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2014 Honey Brook Township

Bid Results
Blacktop
ltem# — 1 total 2 total 3 total 4 total
1500 tons 19 mm 500 tons 25 mm 200 ton Rice Top 200 tons 9.5 mm
Burkholder Paving
~ FOB $48.62 $72,930.00 $45.85 $22,925.00 $62.40 $12,480.00 $54.02 $10,804.00
Delivered $54.52 $81,780.00 $51.75 $25,875.00
Sealcoat
liem# —» 1 total
82,000 sq yds, .38
Martin Paving
Delivered $1.015 $83,230.00
Asphalt Maint
Delivered $1.040 $85,280.00|
Asphait Industries
Delivered $1.04 $85,034.00
¥¥¥¥¥ Stone
. 1 2 3 4 5 6 7 - 8 9 ~ 10 11
AASHTO #1 AASTO #5 AASHTO #8 washed #6 Ballast anti-skid stone sand dirty chip special 2A 3A Diamond Tex 4A
Ind. Constr
FCB $6.75 no bid $7.50| no bid $11.00 no bid ne bid $5.00 $5.25|n¢ bid $6.75
Delivered $13.02 no bid $13.77{no bid _$17.27 no bid no bid $11.27 $11.52|no bid $12.02
Martin Limestone ) o I ot S E
____FoB $6.95 $7.00 $9.20 $8.30 $8.20 $6.45 $4.90| $5.80 $5.70 $17.00  $6.45
Delivered $10.85| $10.90 ~$13.10 $14.20 $12.10 $10.35 $8.80 $9.70 $92.60 $21.95 $10.35
] Diesel | .
{above rack price)
w/o winter additive wf winter additive B
Joanna Oil 0.1200 g2y 0
Reilly and Sons 0.1400 N
Line Painting -
ftem# —>» T 2
144,000 If dy 75,000 if sw
Alpha Space 0.0918 $13,219.20 - 0.0459 $3,442.50




